
From: Pachios, Harold C. [mailto:HPachios@preti.com]  
Sent: Friday, February 20, 2015 3:33 PM 
Subject: RE: Granite Reliable Motion 
 
To: Jane Murray 
 
Jane- I am in receipt of Mr. Roth’s motion which was sent to all interested parties. In order to keep the record straight in 
this matter I have attached below am e-mail chain between Dr. Kilpatrick, the expert witness and Joshua Stayn, in-house 
counsel for Granite. Mr. Stayn’s first e-mail, asking Dr. Kilpatrick for an executed W-9 form in order to pay him, was sent 
to Dr. Kilpatrick prior to Brookfield’s receipt of the Roth motion. In short there is absolutely no dispute to resolve. 
Brookfield has received the executed W-9 form and payment is being processed. Please make sure all interested parties 
are aware of this fact. Thank you. Harold Pachios  
 
 
 
 
Dr. Kilpatrick: 
 
Thank you for responding to my email and for providing the requested information.  I will forward it to our Accounts 
Payable group now and ask that a check be issued expeditiously.  Even so, with the weather here in Boston, it might take 
a few days.  Thank you in advance for your patience. 
 
Regards, 
Joshua 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Charles William Kilpatrick [mailto:wkilpatr@uvm.edu] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 18, 2015 9:51 AM 
To: Stayn, Joshua 
Cc: Peter.Roth@doj.nh.gov 
Subject: Re: payment info 
 
Joshua, 
     Attached is a signed W-9 form for my wildlife consulting firm, Northeastern Wildlife Genetics, Inc.  I have also attached 
a December invoice for the services rendered with a request that the payment be made to Northeastern Wildlife Genetics. 
Please send payment to the following address: 
Northeastern Wildlife Genetics, Inc. 
763 Goose Pond Rd. 
Fairfax, Vermont  05454 
USA 
    Please let me know if you need any additional information. 
 
Bill 
 
C. William Kilpatrick, Director 
Northeastern Wildlife Genetics, Inc 
 
 
Quoting "Stayn, Joshua" <Joshua.Stayn@brookfieldrenewable.com>: 
 
> Good morning Dr. Kilpatrick: 
> 
> In connection with your work on the Granite Site Evaluation Committee  
> proceeding, we require a W-9 and/or other similar identification  
> information so that we can establish you as a vendor to whom payment  
> can be made. Can you please provide that, along with wire instructions  
> or a check address? 
> 



> Thank you, 
> 
> Joshua 
> 
> Joshua L. Stayn 
> Director, Legal Services – Litigation, Regulatory & Compliance North  
> American Operations 
> 
> Brookfield Renewable Energy Group 
> North American Operations 
> 75 State Street, Suite 2701, Boston, MA  
> 02114<x-apple-data-detectors://3/1> 
> T: (508) 251-7696<tel:(508)%20251-7696>  M: (508)  
> 314-9502<tel:(508)%20314-9502>  F:(508) 485-5207<tel:(508)%20485-5207>  
> joshua.stayn@brookfieldrenewable.com<mailto:joshua.stayn@brookfieldren 
> ewable.com> 
> www.brookfieldrenewable.com<http://www.brookfieldrenewable.com/> 
 
 
 
Harold C. Pachios 
Attorney 

PretiFlaherty 
From: Murray, Jane [mailto:Jane.Murray@des.nh.gov]  
Sent: Thursday, February 19, 2015 2:28 PM 
Subject: Granite Reliable Motion 
 
 
 
Attached please find a motion concerning the Granite Reliable project. 
 
Jane Murray 

NH Department of Environmental Services 

Drinking Water & Groundwater Bureau 

Program Assistant 1 

Phone = (603) 271-3139 

Fax = (603) 271-5171 
 


