
From: "Drew, Tim" <Timothy.Drew@des.nh.gov>  
Date: 04/13/2016 4:42 PM (GMT-05:00)  
To: Sarah Allen <sallen@normandeau.com>  
Subject: RE: proof of receipt  
Good afternoon, Sarah. 
  
               I received the applications yesterday (4/12/16) for the Seacoast Reliability Project, accompanied 
by checks from PSNH/Eversource in the amounts of $8,250 and $128,671.60.  If you prefer to deliver 
them to Pam Monroe, please let me know.  I have them locked up at NHDES overnight.  Thanks. 
  
Tim 
  
From: Sarah Allen [mailto:sallen@normandeau.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, April 13, 2016 2:33 PM 
To: Drew, Tim 
Cc: Dumville, Adam (Adam.Dumville@MCLANE.com) 
Subject: proof of receipt 
  
Tim, 
Thanks for receiving the Seacoast Reliability Project permit applications.   We were supposed to have 
delivered the checks to Pam Munroe with the SEC filing, rather than to DES.  Would you please provide 
an email stating that you received the documents and the checks were enclosed that we can forward to 
Pam?  
Thanks very much, 
Sarah 
  
SARAH ALLEN, Sr. Principal Wetland Scientist 
Normandeau Associates, Inc. 
25 Nashua Road, Bedford, NH 03110 
603-637-1158 (direct), 603-714-3085 (cell) 
sallen@normandeau.com   www.normandeau.com 
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